
Jan Krakowiak

List of Publications by Year
in descending order

Source: https://exaly.com/author-pdf/4040817/publications.pdf

Version: 2024-02-01

17

papers

61

citations

4

h-index

1937685

7

g-index

1720034

17

all docs

17

docs citations

17

times ranked

90

citing authors



Jan Krakowiak

2

# Article IF Citations

1 The Sense of Coherence and Health Behavior of Men with Alcohol Addiction. International Journal of
Environmental Research and Public Health, 2022, 19, 8650. 2.6 1

2 Anxiety and Depression in Women with Polycystic Ovary Syndrome. Medicina (Lithuania), 2022, 58, 942. 2.0 9

3
Characteristics of osteoporotic vertebral fractures in association with symptomatic status in
postmenopausal women â€“ a retrospective study of a single centre in Poland. Annals of Agricultural
and Environmental Medicine, 2021, 28, 654-658.

1.0 1

4 Genetic aspects of pain and its variability in the human population. Annals of Agricultural and
Environmental Medicine, 2021, 28, 569-574. 1.0 4

5
Exposure to Environmental Tobacco Smoke (ETS) among Employees of Hospitality Venues in the Light
of Changes in Anti-Tobacco Legislation in Poland. International Journal of Environmental Research
and Public Health, 2020, 17, 3691.

2.6 1

6 Factors determining health behaviours of the 50+ population with cardiovascular diseases. Annals of
Agricultural and Environmental Medicine, 2020, 27, 99-105. 1.0 1

7 Patient safety culture in Polish Primary Healthcare Centers. International Journal for Quality in
Health Care, 2019, 31, G60-G66. 1.8 5

8 Environmental variations of nutritional mistakes among Polish school-age adolescents from urban
and rural areas. Annals of Agricultural and Environmental Medicine, 2019, 26, 483-488. 1.0 4

9 Physical activity as an important element in organizing and managing the lifestyle of populations in
urban and rural environments. Annals of Agricultural and Environmental Medicine, 2019, 26, 8-12. 1.0 16

10
Duration of breastfeeding and psychomotor development in 1-year-old children â€“ Polish Mother and
Child Cohort Study. International Journal of Occupational Medicine and Environmental Health, 2019,
32, 175-184.

1.3 3

11 Stress at intellectual work and cardiovascular diseases in women at non-mobility working age.
Annals of Agricultural and Environmental Medicine, 2019, 26, 456-461. 1.0 4

12 Atherogenic lipid profile and health behaviours in women post-menopause working in agriculture.
Annals of Agricultural and Environmental Medicine, 2019, 26, 585-591. 1.0 3

13 Face-to-face anti-tobacco intervention lowers cotinine level in asthmatic children. Annals of Allergy,
Asthma and Immunology, 2018, 120, 544-546. 1.0 1

14 Gender, age, social disadvantage and quitting smoking in Argentina and Uruguay. Annals of
Agricultural and Environmental Medicine, 2018, 25, 100-107. 1.0 3

15 Factors Influencing the Opinion of Patients Concerning the Functioning of the Polish Hospital Before
and After Ownership Transformation. Inquiry (United States), 2015, 52, 004695801557201. 0.9 1

16 Complying with the smoking ban by students before and after introducing legislative intervention.
International Journal of Occupational Medicine and Environmental Health, 2015, 28, 369-78. 1.3 2

17 Effects of Changes in Ownership of the Polish Hospital on the Patientsâ€™ Opinion About Its
Functioning. Inquiry (United States), 2014, 51, 004695801456043. 0.9 2


